
Find Hope & Purpose in Jesus! 


How Can I Be Saved?

www.spiritualwarfare.blog/saved


How Can I Be Sure I’m Saved?

www.spiritualwarfare.blog/examine


Evidence for Jesus

www.spiritualwarfare.blog/evidence


Helpful YouTube Videos

www.youtube.com/@trustworthyword


Free Bible Reading Plans:

www.trustworthyword.com/bible-reading-plans 


Free Downloadable Books:

www.spiritualwarfare.blog/free-books 


The Whole Bible Story:

 Summarized in 20 Minutes


www.southfork.church/the-whole-bible-in-20-minutes


7 Questions to Check Your Heart

Psalm 33 (ESV)


1. Do you have joy in the Lord?

• [1] Shout for joy in the LORD, O you righteous! Praise befits 

the upright. [2] Give thanks to the LORD with the lyre; make 
melody to him with the harp of ten strings! [3] Sing to him a 
new song; play skillfully on the strings, with loud shouts.


• Galatians 5:22–24 “But the fruit of the Spirit is love, joy, 
peace, patience, kindness, goodness, faithfulness, [23] 
gentleness, self-control; against such things there is no law. 
[24] And those who belong to Christ Jesus have crucified the 
flesh with its passions and desires.”


• Worship in Singing - www.trustworthyword.com/what-does-
the-bible-say-about-worship-through-singing 


	 


2. Are you in awe of His works?

• [4] For the word of the LORD is upright, and all his work is 

done in faithfulness. [5] He loves righteousness and justice; 
the earth is full of the steadfast love of the LORD.


• 176 Miracles of God - www.trustworthyword.com/miracles 
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3. Do you see God and His power in creation?

• [6] By the word of the LORD the heavens were made, and by 

the breath of his mouth all their host. [7] He gathers the 
waters of the sea as a heap; he puts the deeps in storehouses. 
[8] Let all the earth fear the LORD; let all the inhabitants of 
the world stand in awe of him! [9] For he spoke, and it came to 
be; he commanded, and it stood firm.


• Romans 1:19–20 “For what can be known about God is plain 
to them, because God has shown it to them. [20] For his 
invisible attributes, namely, his eternal power and divine 
nature, have been clearly perceived, ever since the creation of 
the world, in the things that have been made. So they are 
without excuse.”


4. Do you trust God’s plan in politics?

• [10] The LORD brings the counsel of the nations to nothing; 

he frustrates the plans of the peoples. [11] The counsel of the 
LORD stands forever, the plans of his heart to all generations. 
[12] Blessed is the nation whose God is the LORD, the people 
whom he has chosen as his heritage!


• Politics - www.trustworthyword.com/what-does-the-bible-
say-about-voting-and-politics 


5. Do you have peace with God’s watchful eye?

• [13] The LORD looks down from heaven; he sees all the 

children of man; [14] from where he sits enthroned he looks 
out on all the inhabitants of the earth, [15] he who fashions the 
hearts of them all and observes all their deeds.


• Matthew 12:36–37 “I tell you, on the day of judgment people 
will give account for every careless word they speak, [37] for 
by your words you will be justified, and by your words you will 
be condemned.”


• Hebrews 4:13 “And no creature is hidden from his sight, but 
all are naked and exposed to the eyes of him to whom we must 
give account.”


6. Are you confident in the Lord’s strength?

• [16] The king is not saved by his great army; a warrior is not 

delivered by his great strength. [17] The war horse is a false 
hope for salvation, and by its great might it cannot rescue. [18] 
Behold, the eye of the LORD is on those who fear him, on 
those who hope in his steadfast love, [19] that he may deliver 
their soul from death and keep them alive in famine.


• 2 Corinthians 12:9–10 “But he said to me, ‘My grace is 
sufficient for you, for my power is made perfect in weakness.’ 
Therefore I will boast all the more gladly of my weaknesses, so 
that the power of Christ may rest upon me. [10] For the sake of 
Christ, then, I am content with weaknesses, insults, hardships, 
persecutions, and calamities. For when I am weak, then I am 
strong.”


7. How is your soul?	 

• [20] Our soul waits for the LORD; he is our help and our 

shield. [21] For our heart is glad in him, because we trust in 
his holy name. [22] Let your steadfast love, O LORD, be upon 
us, even as we hope in you.


• Psalm 85:6–7 "Will you not revive us again, that your people 
may rejoice in you? [7] Show us your steadfast love, O LORD, 
and grant us your salvation.”
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